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Dear Cathy
 
Thank you for your questions and apologies for the lack of clarity on our part.
 
Yes, our intended request in respect of the Independent Adviser was for 

 
In respect of both the  additional external advice/drafting services
and the 

 
So if my math is correct, that would make the range from (representing 13 months) up

representing 18 months)
 
I hope this provides sufficient information for your inputs to the Authority’s consideration.
 
Happy to discuss further.
 

​

​
​

​​I acknowledge the Traditional Custodians of the lands on which I work and reside, the Gadigal People of the Eora Nation,
and I pay my respects to their Elders, past, present, and emerging.

​​NOTICE: This email message is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and
privileged information. Any unauthorised review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the
intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the original message.
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Dear 
 
I am in the process of finalising the approval for the TCP Code reimbursement and am trying to
reconcile the numbers across the various correspondence to be sure we are seeking approval for
the correct amount.
 
The request was for or a period from 1 July 2023 – 31 July 2024, with a
potential extension out to 31 December 2024 if needed.  It also asked for up to 

 
I noticed the draft contract for the IA talks .   Is 

 

 
Finally, the calculation of the estimated cost range for the IA appears incorrect. At

. The
CA application presents the estimate range  

 
Thanks and give me a call if you want to discuss.
 
Regards
 
Cath
 
 
 
Cathy Rainsford
General Manager Content & Consumer Division
_____________________________

Australian Communications and Media Authority
T +61 2 6219 5500  M +61 477  357 336
E cathy.rainsford@acma.gov.au
www.acma.gov.au
 
Executive Assistant: Anna Sergi
T +61 2 6219 5332
E anna.sergi@acma.gov.au 
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